
 

 

 

 

 
 
 
Official Form 410 
Proof of Claim           04/16 

Read the instructions before filling out this form. This form is for making a claim for payment in a bankruptcy case. Do not use this form to 
make a request for payment of an administrative expense. Make such a request according to 11 U.S.C. § 503. 

Filers must leave out or redact information that is entitled to privacy on this form or on any attached documents. Attach redacted copies or any 
documents that support the claim, such as promissory notes, purchase orders, invoices, itemized statements of running accounts, contracts, judgments, 
mortgages, and security agreements. Do not send original documents; they may be destroyed after scanning. If the documents are not available, 
explain in an attachment. 

A person who files a fraudulent claim could be fined up to $500,000, imprisoned for up to 5 years, or both. 18 U.S.C. §§ 152, 157, and 3571. 

Fill in all the information about the claim as of the date the case was filed. That date is on the notice of bankruptcy (Form 309) that you received. 

 

Part 1: Identify the Claim 

1. Who is the current   
creditor?   

Name of the current creditor (the person or entity to be paid for this claim) 
 
Other names the creditor used with the debtor       

2. Has this claim been 
acquired from 
someone else? 

 No 

 Yes.     From whom?    

3. Where should 
notices and 
payments to the 
creditor be sent? 

 
Federal Rule of 
Bankruptcy Procedure 
(FRBP) 2002(g) 

Where should notices to the creditor be sent?  Where should payments to the creditor be sent? (if 
different) 

  
Name 

  
Number          Street 

  
City                                                  State                         ZIP Code 

Contact phone       

Contact email        

 

  
Name 

  
Number          Street 

  
City                                                  State                         ZIP Code 

Contact phone       

Contact email       

 

Uniform claim identifier for electronic payments in chapter 13 (if you use one): 

___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ ___ 

4. Does this claim 
amend one already 
filed? 

 No 

 Yes.     Claim number on court claims registry (if known)    Filed on     
    MM     /     DD     /     YYYY 

5. Do you know if 
anyone else has filed 
a proof of claim for 
this claim? 

 No 

 Yes. Who made the earlier filing?        

 

Fill in this information to identify the case: 

Debtor         

 
United States Bankruptcy Court for the:     District of    
  (State) 
 
Case number       
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Part 2: Give Information About the Claim as of the Date the Case Was Filed 

6. Do you have any number 
you use to identify the 
debtor? 

 No 

 Yes. Last 4 digits of the debtor’s account or any number you use to identify the debtor:  ___  ___  ___  ___ 

7. How much is the claim? $   . Does this amount include interest or other charges? 

   No 

   Yes. Attach statement itemizing interest, fees, expenses, or other 
          charges required by Bankruptcy Rule 3001(c)(2)(A). 

8. What is the basis of the 
claim? 

Examples: Goods sold, money loaned, lease, services performed, personal injury or wrongful death, or credit card. 

Attach redacted copies of any documents supporting the claim required by Bankruptcy Rule 3001(c). 

Limit disclosing information that is entitled to privacy, such as health care information. 

         

9. Is all or part of the claim 
secured?  

 No 

 Yes.   The claim is secured by a lien on property. 

  Nature or property: 

   Real estate: If the claim is secured by the debtor’s principle residence, file a Mortgage Proof of  
   Claim Attachment (Official Form 410-A) with this Proof of Claim. 

   Motor vehicle 

   Other. Describe:         

 

  Basis for perfection:         

  Attach redacted copies of documents, if any, that show evidence of perfection of a security interest (for  
  example, a mortgage, lien, certificate of title, financing statement, or other document that shows the lien 
  has been filed or recorded.) 

 

 

  Value of property: $  

  Amount of the claim that is secured: $  

  Amount of the claim that is unsecured: $  (The sum of the secured and unsecured 
      amount should match the amount in line 7.) 

 

  Amount necessary to cure any default as of the date of the petition: $  

 

  Annual Interest Rate (when case was filed) % 

   Fixed 

   Variable 
 

10. Is this claim based on a 
lease? 

 No 

 Yes. Amount necessary to cure any default as of the date of the petition. $    

11. Is this claim subject to a 
right of setoff? 

 No 

 Yes. Identify the property:          
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12. Is all or part of the claim 
entitled to priority under 
11 U.S.C. § 507(a)? 
 
A claim may be partly 
priority and partly 
nonpriority. For example, 
in some categories, the 
law limits the amount 
entitled to priority. 

 No 

 Yes. Check all that apply: 

  Domestic support obligations (including alimony and child support) under 
  11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(1)(A) or (a)(1)(B). 

  Up to $2,850* of deposits toward purchase, lease, or rental of property or 
  services for personal, family, or household use. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(7). 

  Wages, salaries, or commissions (up to $12,850*) earned within 180  
  days before the bankruptcy petition is filed or the debtor’s business ends, 
  whichever is earlier. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(4). 

  Taxes or penalties owed to governmental units. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(8). 

  Contributions to an employee benefit plan. 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(5). 

  Other. Specify subsection of 11 U.S.C. § 507(a)(__) that applies. 

Amount entitled to priority 

$  

$  

$  

$  

$  

$  

 *  Amounts are subject to adjustment on 4/01/19 and every 3 years after that for cases begun on or after the date of adjustment. 

13. Is all or part of the claim 
pursuant to 11 U.S.C.      
§ 503(b)(9)? 

 No 

 Yes. Indicate the amount of your claim arising from the value of any goods received by the debtor within 20 
 days before the date of commencement of the above case, in which the goods have been sold to the Debtor in 
 the ordinary course of such Debtor’s business. Attach documentation supporting such claim. 

 $  

 

Part 3: Sign Below 

The person completing 
this proof of claim must 
sign and date it. 
FRBP 9011(b).  

If you file this claim 
electronically, FRBP 
5005(a)(2) authorizes courts 
to establish local rules 
specifying what a signature 
is. 

A person who files a 
fraudulent claim could be 
fined up to $500,000, 
imprisoned for up to 5 
years, or both. 
18 U.S.C. §§ 152, 157, and 
3571. 

Check the appropriate box: 

 I am the creditor. 

 I am the creditor’s attorney or authorized agent. 

 I am the trustee, or the debtor, or their authorized agent. Bankruptcy Rule 3004. 

 I am a guarantor, surety, endorser, or other codebtor. Bankruptcy Rule 3005. 

I understand that an authorized signature on this Proof of Claim serves as an acknowledgement that when calculating 
the amount of the claim, the creditor gave the debtor credit for any payments received toward the debt. 

I have examined the information in this Proof of Claim and have reasonable belief that the information is true and correct. 

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct. 

Executed on date       
   MM   /   DD   /   YYYY 

 
 
 
      
 Signature 

 
Print the name of the person who is completing and signing this claim: 

Name      
   First name Middle name  Last name 

Title        
 
Company       
   Identify the corporate servicer as the company if the authorized agent is a servicer. 
 
 
Address       
   Number Street 
 
        
   City  State ZIP Code 
 
Contact phone   Email   
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Debtor:

18-13663 - Waypoint Asset Company Number 1 (Ireland) Limited
District:

Southern District of New York, New York Division
Creditor:

ABNR Counsellors at Law
Gustaaf Olivier Reerink
Graha CIMB Niaga 24th Floor
Jalan Jend. Sudirman Kav. 58

Jakarta Selatan, DKI Jakart, 12190
Indonesia
Phone:

+62 21 250 5125
Phone 2:

+628111038714
Fax:

Email:

greerink@abnrlaw.com

Has Supporting Documentation:

Yes, supporting documentation successfully uploaded
Related Document Statement:

Has Related Claim:

No
Related Claim Filed By:

Filing Party:

Creditor

Other Names Used with Debtor: Amends Claim:

No
Acquired Claim:

No
Basis of Claim:

legal services performed
Last 4 Digits:

No
Uniform Claim Identifier:

Total Amount of Claim:

41413.31
Includes Interest or Charges:

Yes
Has Priority Claim:

No
Priority Under:

Has Secured Claim:

No
Amount of 503(b)(9):

No
Based on Lease:

No
Subject to Right of Setoff:

No

Nature of Secured Amount:

Value of Property:

Annual Interest Rate:

Arrearage Amount:

Basis for Perfection:

Amount Unsecured:

Submitted By:

Emir Nurmansyah on 28-May-2019 2:15:18 p.m. Eastern Time
Title:

Partner
Company:

ABNR Counsellors at Law

KCC ePOC Electronic Claim Filing Summary

For phone assistance: Domestic (888) 733-1446  | International (310) 751-2635 

VN: 115419DDF4D09F4AB359B17424E54F5D

































 
 
 
 
 
 
 No: DRAFT/HFW-17092/EN(OJM)-GOR 

Jakarta, 28 May 2019 

 

 
INVOICE 
TO: 

 
Waypoint Asset Company Number 1  
(Ireland) Limited 
8 Riverpoint, Bishops Quay Limerick 
V94 WC6A, Ireland 
 
Attn legal@waypointleasing.com  
 

 
 
We submit our bill to you for the following: 

 

 

 

Ali Budiardjo, Nugroho, Reksodiputro 

I N V O I C E  

 

Payment is due upon receipt of this invoice 

Note : 
1. Please refer our invoice number in making your payment 
2. Please make payment by transfer to: 
 
Account name : Ali Budiardjo, Nugroho, Reksodiputro 
Account number : 8000-3102-2540 (USD) 
Bank  : CIMB Niaga, Jakarta, Indonesia 
Swift code : BNIAIDJA 

Tan Yuliana   
Billing & Tax Officer 

Page 1 of 1 

Description Amount 

Statement of fees and disbursement for professional service rendered in the 
period 11 January 2017 to 01 November 2017 in relation to Leasing Transaction 
- AW139 Helicopter - Air Born Indonesia 

 

Legal fees US$9,500.00 

Disbursement and Out of Pocket Expenses: US$969.73 

1. Translation Fees US$104.96 
2. Ticket and hotel accommodation for meeting in KL US$389.77 
3. Out of Pocket Expenses 5% US$475.00 

 + 

Sub-total US$10,469.73 

10% VAT US$1,046.97 

 + 

TOTAL US$11,516.70 

 ==============   

mailto:legal@waypointleasing.com


 

 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED BY CASE 
Period From: 11 January 2017 up to 01 November 2017 in relation to Leasing Transaction - AW139 Helicopter - Air Born Indonesia  

 

MATTER CODE: HFW-17092A 

Date  Author Description Units* Rate Amount 
11 Jan 2017 PA Reviewing draft aircraft lease agreement 2.50 275.00 687.50 

12 Jan 2017 GOR Prepare markup lease agreement. 3.42 425.00 1,453.50 

13 Jan 2017 GOR Finalise markup lease agreement. 0.70 425.00 297.50 

13 Jan 2017 PA Discussing Internal discussions regarding the draft 
aircraft lease agreement 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

17 Jan 2017 GOR Review email re follow up question relating to 
markup lease agreement. 

0.10 425.00 42.50 

18 Jan 2017 GOR Draft email to Mr Zik; revise markup lease 
agreement. 

0.80 425.00 340.00 

19 Jan 2017 GOR Finalise draft email to Mr Zik, revised markup of 
lease agreement. 

0.57 425.00 242.25 

20 Jan 2017 GOR Draft email to Mr Zik; amend Lease; draft email to 
Ms Foster; amend checklist. 

0.70 425.00 297.50 

20 Jan 2017 PA Reviewing and finalizing draft responses for the 
client 

0.93 275.00 254.51 

03 Feb 2017 PA Preparing 1st draft LO for the transaction 2.50 275.00 687.50 

13 Feb 2017 GOR Meeting with Airod for discussion helicopter lease 
agreement (in KL) 

8.00 425.00 3,399.99 

16 Feb 2017 GOR Emails to Mr Knott, Mr Sharma re finalisation lease 
agreement, side letter. 

0.20 425.00 85.00 

16 Feb 2017 PA Reviewing draft aircraft lease agreement & side 
letter, internal discussions 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

17 Feb 2017 PA Reviewing draft aircraft lease agreement & side 
letter, internal discussions 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

01 Mar 2017 GOR Emails to Mr Knott, Mr Zik; call with Mr Robson; 
prepare docs in fulfilment of CPs 

0.47 425.00 199.75 

    
 TOTAL UNITS FOR HFW-17092A 26.39 
 TOTAL FEES FOR HFW-17092A US$9,500.00 
    
 
*1 Units = 60 Minutes 

 
  



 
 
 
 
 
 
 No: DRAFT/HFW-17092A/EN(OJM)-GOR 

Jakarta, 28 May 2019 

 

 
INVOICE 
TO: 

 
Waypoint Asset Company Number 1  
(Ireland) Limited 
8 Riverpoint, Bishops Quay Limerick 
V94 WC6A, Ireland 
 
Attn legal@waypointleasing.com  
 

 
 
We submit our bill to you for the following: 

 

 

 

Ali Budiardjo, Nugroho, Reksodiputro 

I N V O I C E  

 

Payment is due upon receipt of this invoice 

Note : 
1. Please refer our invoice number in making your payment 
2. Please make payment by transfer to: 
 
Account name : Ali Budiardjo, Nugroho, Reksodiputro 
Account number : 8000-3102-2540 (USD) 
Bank  : CIMB Niaga, Jakarta, Indonesia 
Swift code : BNIAIDJA 

Tan Yuliana 
Billing & Tax Officer 

Page 1 of 1 

Description Amount 

Statement of fees and disbursement for professional service rendered in the 
period 07 January 2017 to 1 November 2017 in relation to Leasing Transaction 
- AW139 Helicopter - Air Born Indonesia. 

 

Legal fees US$25,884.50 

Disbursement and Out of Pocket Expenses: US$2,263.95 

• Out of Pocket Expenses 5% US$  1,294.23 

 + 

Sub-total US$27,178.73 

10% VAT US$  2,717.87 

 + 

TOTAL US$29,896.60 

 ==============   

mailto:legal@waypointleasing.com


 

 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED BY CASE 
Period From: 07 January 2017 up to 14 November 2017 in relation to Leasing Transaction - AW139 Helicopter - Air Born Indonesia   

 

MATTER CODE: HFW-17092 

Date  Author Description Units* Rate Amount 

07-Jan-17 PA 
Preparing fee quote and initial advice for 
Waypoint Leasing on leasing with Air Born 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

09-Jan-17 PA Reviewing fee quote, internal discussions 1.00 275.00 275.00 
09-Jan-17 OJM Queries from client. 3.00 475.00 1,425.00 

16-Jan-17 PA 
Preparing Regulatory research and preparing 
draft responses to the client's queries 

3.00 275.00 825.00 

16-Jan-17 PA 
Preparing marked up closing checklist for the 
client 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

19-Jan-17 PA 
Reviewing and finalizing draft response for the 
client 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

20-Jan-17 PA 
Reviewing and finalizing draft responses for the 
client 

0.58 275.00 158.00 

03-Feb-17 GOR Coordinate meeting in KL. 0.20 425.00 85.00 
10-Feb-17 GOR Prepare trip to KL. 0.50 425.00 212.50 

02-Mar-17 GOR 
Emails to Guy re docs for CP; coordinate drafting 
and review docs (IDERA, DPOA, letter of 
authorisation); coordinate drafting legal opinion. 

1.40 425.00 595.00 

02-Mar-17 PA 
Preparing drafts of IDERA, DPOA and Letters of 
Authority in connection with the transaction 

2.50 275.00 687.50 

02-Mar-17 PA Discussing Internal discussions on MoT 45/2015 1.50 275.00 412.50 

03-Mar-17 GOR 
Email to Mr Zik; email to Pak Ruel re corporate 
docs and approvals. 

0.20 425.00 85.00 

03-Mar-17 OJM Queries from client. 2.00 475.00 950.00 

04-Mar-17 GOR 
Prepare advice re capital increase requirement; 
email to Guy. 

0.50 425.00 212.50 

04-Mar-17 PA Discussing Internal discussions on MoT 45/2015 2.00 275.00 550.00 

06-Mar-17 PA 
Research By phone research with the DGCA in 
connection with MoT 45/2015 

1.00 275.00 275.00 

06-Mar-17 GOR 

Review LO; coordinate check with MOT; emails to 
Guy re capital increase requirement, LO, delivery 
C of R, CPs and CS. email to Chris re contact 
Ruel; emails to and phone call with Ruel. 

2.00 425.00 850.00 

06-Mar-17 PA 
Research By phone research with the DGCA in 
connection with MoT 45/2015 

1.00 275.00 275.00 

06-Mar-17 PA 
Liaising Liaisons with the client regarding MoT 
45/2015, reviewing draft e-mail for the client 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

06-Mar-17 PA Revising draft of legal opinion for the client 1.50 275.00 412.50 

08-Mar-17 GOR 
Review waiver letter; emails to Guy; email to 
Ruel. 

0.40 425.00 170.00 

08-Mar-17 PA Reviewing draft waiver letter 0.50 275.00 137.50 

09-Mar-17 GOR 
Emails to Ruel; email to Zohar, Chris re CS 
capitalization requirement; review revised LO. 

0.30 425.00 127.50 

09-Mar-17 PA 
Discussing Internal discussions on aviation matter 
CP requirements 

1.00 275.00 275.00 

10-Mar-17 PA Reviewing and revising draft legal opinion 2.00 275.00 550.00 

17-Mar-17 GOR 
Email to Guy; phone call and email to Pak Ruel re 
outstanding CPs. 

0.20 425.00 85.00 

17-Mar-17 PA Reviewing draft response for the client 1.50 275.00 412.50 
20-Mar-17 GOR Phone call to Ruel; email to Mr Zik, Mr Knott. 0.20 425.00 85.00 

31-Mar-17 PA 
Liaising Liaisons with external translator regarding 
preparation of Indonesian translation, internal 
discussions 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

31-Mar-17 PA 
Reviewing and updating lease agreement and its 
Indonesian translation 

1.50 275.00 412.50 



 

 

03-Apr-17 PA 
Reviewing Preparing and reviewing Indonesian 
translations of transaction documents 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

31-May-17 GOR 

Emails to Mr Zak and Mr Knott; follow-up; review 
translation lease agreement, side letters; email to 
Air Born; check fulfiment CPs; update closing 
checklist. 

1.93 425.00 820.25 

31-May-17 PA 
Preparing bilingual version of MSN 31414 Side 
letter No 2 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

31-May-17 PA 
Internal discussions, review of tansaction 
documents 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

02-Jun-17 PA Arranging company search with Ditjen AHU 1.00 275.00 275.00 

02-Jun-17 PA 
Finalizing Internal discussions, preparing 
execution versions of the transction documents 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

03-Jun-17 PA 
Reviewing corporate document and board 
resolutions 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

05-Jun-17 GOR 
Holman: finalise checklist; email to Pak Ruel re 
outstanding CPs. 

0.50 425.00 212.50 

05-Jun-17 PA 
Reviewing corporate document and board 
resolutions, reviewing draft response to the 
counterpart 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

07-Jun-17 GOR 
Holman: Email to Mr Knott re execution 
Indonesian version of transaction docs. 

0.10 425.00 42.50 

14-Jun-17 GOR Emails to Mr Knott; update CP letter. 0.20 425.00 85.00 

21-Jul-17 PA 
Research Draft acceptance review, research on 
Indonesian law aspects of foreign law lease 
novation, internal discussions 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

21-Jul-17 GOR Email to Mr Zik re novation agreement. 0.20 425.00 85.00 

24-Jul-17 PA 
Reviewing 4 draft documents in connection with 
MSN 31414 sent by the client 

3.50 275.00 962.50 

24-Jul-17 GOR 
Review docs for novation; email to Mr Knott; 
coordinate translation novation deed. 

0.40 425.00 170.00 

25-Jul-17 PA 
Preparing Coordinating Indonesian translation by 
external translators, preparing standard 
translation of wordings 

1.00 275.00 275.00 

25-Jul-17 PA 
Research with the DGCA regarding latest IDERA 
forms 

1.00 275.00 275.00 

25-Jul-17 GOR 
Email to Mr Zik and Mr Robson; review DPOA, 
IDERA form, Letter of Authority, Deed of 
Novation. 

1.50 425.00 637.50 

26-Jul-17 PA 
Revising Reviewing draft documents in 
connection with MSN 31414 sent by the client 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

27-Jul-17 PA 
Reviewing and finalizing Indonesian translation by 
external translators 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

27-Jul-17 PA 
Preparing hard copy IDERA form to be readily 
executed by the lessee 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

27-Jul-17 PA Discussing Internal discussions 0.50 275.00 137.50 
16-Aug-17 GOR Email to Mr Robson; follow-up. 0.20 425.00 85.00 

16-Aug-17 PA 
Research and preparing first draft response for 
the client 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

16-Aug-17 PA Preparing billingual draft of Side Letter No. 3 1.50 275.00 412.50 
18-Aug-17 GOR Review bilingual side letter; email to Mr Robson. 0.30 425.00 127.50 
18-Aug-17 PA Preparing draft response for the client 1.00 275.00 275.00 

18-Aug-17 PA 
Finalizing Reviewing, Finalizing bilingual draft od 
Side Letter No. 3 

1.50 275.00 412.50 

25-Sep-17 PA 
Revising Reviewing and revising draft response 
for the client, reviewing transaction documents 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

25-Sep-17 PA 
Revising Reviewing and revising draft response 
for the client, reviewing transaction documents 

2.00 275.00 550.00 

25-Sep-17 GOR 
Email to Chris and Guy re Indonesian docs, 
signing instructions. 

0.30 425.00 127.50 



 

 

26-Sep-17 PA 
Reviewing draft response for the client, reviewing 
transaction documents 

1.00 275.00 275.00 

26-Sep-17 GOR 
Email to Chris and Guy re further questions 
signing and IDERA. 

0.30 425.00 127.50 

30-Oct-17 GOR Prepare advice re SOP/bankruptcy scenario. 0.50 425.00 212.50 

30-Oct-17 KOS 
Reviewing and commenting draft advice prepared 
by GOR re: bankruptcy law rules on executory 
contract 

0.25 425.00 106.25 

31-Oct-17 GOR Finalize advice re SOP/bankruptcy scenario. 0.80 425.00 340.00 
31-Oct-17 KOS Commenting draft advice re: retention right 0.25 425.00 106.25 

01-Nov-17 KOS 
Commenting draft advice re: bankruptcy rules on 
lease 

0.25 425.00 106.25 

01-Nov-17 GOR Finalize advice re SOP/bankruptcy scenario. 0.30 425.00 127.50 
      
  TOTAL UNITS FOR HFW-17092  109.14  

  TOTAL FEES FOR HFW-17092  US$25,884.50  

 
*1 Units = 60 Minutes 

 
 




